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This research aims to analyze the factors that influence economic growth in Indonesia 
for the 1983-2022 period. The Error Correction Model (ECM) analysis method was used 
with the help of Eviews 12. Time series data was used for this research from 1983-2022 
which was obtained from the Indonesian Central Statistics Agency (BPS). The economic 
growth indicator is used as the dependent variable, while the poverty rate, employment 
rate, unemployment rate, and APBN are independent variables. The main topic of 
research discussion is only related to the information presented by researchers which 
is focused on the poor population, labor force participation rate, open unemployment 
rate, state income, and GDP based on business fields. The results of empirical tests using 
Error Correction Model (ECM) analysis determine that the level of poverty in the long 
term has a significant negative influence on economic growth in Indonesia but not in the 
short term. In the long term, the employment level has a significant negative effect along 
with the short term on economic growth, the unemployment rate variable does not have 
a significant effect in the long term but not in the short term, while state income in the 
APBN in the long and short term has a significant positive effect on economic growth. 
in Indonesia.
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INTRODUCTION
 Economic growth is one of the 
country’s problems over a long period of 
time and has interrelated processes and is 
able to influence the factors analyzed. Do-
mestic economic policies are carried out to 
maintain economic balance which is useful 
for controlling and predicting global eco-
nomic turmoil, positive trends in economic 
growth indicate the stability of ideal macro-
economic conditions (Hariyanti & Soekap-
djo, 2020).
 The macroeconomic component 
of economic growth can be measured in 
Gross Domestic Product, which is an im-
portant factor in the economy as a deter-
minant of policies, government plans, and 
aims to increase a country’s sovereignty 
(Khan et al., 2022). Forecasting and esti-
mating economic growth with GDP is used 
to assess the importance of an economic 
policy (Cepni et al., 2020).
 Gross Domestic Product (GDP) 
can be described as an indicator of the rate 
of economic growth. Relatively stable eco-
nomic growth can be said to be a region 
or country that has succeeded in improv-
ing the welfare of its people, based on data 
from the Central Statistics Agency (BPS) 
by the National Socioeconomic Survey 
(Susenas), economic growth in Indonesia 
based on GDP in 2022 will reach 5.3 per-
cent seen from the growth rate economics 
in the business field. Showing that in In-
donesia economic growth can be felt that 
there has been a fluctuating increase from 
2020 after the Covid-19 pandemic. Gov-
ernment policy aims to increase economic 
growth which can have an impact on so-
cietal disparities and poverty levels, how-
ever high economic growth is a challenge 
that must be faced by developing countries 
(Olowofela et al., 2018).
 External and internal economic 
turmoil in developing countries has made 
Indonesia increase its economic progress 
with the hope of producing an economic 
system that functions well is balanced and 

is resilient in facing problems in economic 
growth (Bashir et al., 2019). Macroeco-
nomic policies are determined to provide 
benefits for the country to overcome eco-
nomic problems by adopting appropriate 
and stable policies so that waste does not 
occur (Akobeng, 2020).
 State problems such as demo-
graphic problems that affect the economy 
in Indonesia include poverty, labor force 
participation rates, poverty, and the coun-
try’s income. Poverty is a world problem 
that needs to be addressed because the 
level of poverty is included in several fac-
tors that become a serious problem for a 
country which results in slow economic 
development (Agustin, 2022). The num-
ber of poor people in Indonesia continues 
to decrease, but poverty is still considered 
a quite fatal problem, poverty is a condi-
tion where a person cannot meet basic 
needs as measured by their expenditure 
(Jauhari & Periansya, 2021). According to 
the World Bank at the Fiscal Policy Agency 
of the Ministry of Finance in 2022, the re-
duction in the poverty rate at the threshold 
of Indonesia’s poverty line has increased, 
which can have an impact on sharing risks 
in the economy. Poverty eradication policy 
actions are carried out to have a positive 
impact on the workforce (Maipita, 2018).
 The labor production factor is a cru-
cial component of a country’s economy. Ac-
tions to absorb work energy are needed to 
stabilize and improve community welfare, 
providing development effects that are ex-
pected to reduce poverty, prosperity, and 
the emergence of various social problems 
(Komariyah et al., 2020). The way to find 
out the proportion of work in the labor force 
to population growth can be seen from the 
work participation rate in the labor force. 
Based on the Central Statistics Agency, 
the labor force participation rate (TPAK) is 
the labor force ratio related to the quantity 
of the working-age population between 15 
and 64 years. Structural change is a transi-
tion from traditional society to modern so-
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ciety making a modern industrial economy. 
The large number of job opportunities and 
labor productivity, stock capital, use of new 
sources, and improvements in technology 
will add to industrial structural changes 
that can absorb more and better workers 
which can reduce the unemployment rate 
(Suindyah, 2018).
 The increasing economy is a re-
flection of economic development. Another 
thing is that when economic growth is un-
able to develop, one of the problems that 
will arise is unemployment. The existence 
of regulations, taxes, and tariffs that apply 
to economic activities with relatively low 
barriers have an impact both on economic 
growth directly and indirectly and can influ-
ence the reduction of unemployment and 
increase demand for labor, but is economic 
globalization able to have a positive impact 
on the economy? its impact on economic 
activity reducing the unemployment rate? 
or cause high fluctuations in unemployment 
rates (Setyawan et al., 2021). According to 
the Central Statistics Agency, in 2022 the 
percentage of open unemployment will be 
5.8 percent with a labor force participation 
rate of 68.9 percent. This means that em-
ployment opportunities have not been able 
to absorb the entire workforce so many 
people are still unemployed.
 Regulations set by the govern-
ment at a time when the number of unem-
ployed is increasing along with increasing 
demand for state services and unemploy-
ment funds are decreasing rapidly, the 
state must take brutal budget measures to 
deal with the impact (Rubin & Willoughby, 
2021). Fiscal policy is needed to anticipate 
unemployment problems that occur as an 
alternative form of national economic resil-
ience (Joyce & Suryo Prabowo, 2020).
 The APBN is the state revenue and 
expenditure budget which is one of the fis-
cal policies for annual financial planning 
of a country which is an indicator of eco-
nomic growth, namely as a tool for regulat-
ing the inflow and outflow of the APBN for 

state capital. development and actualiza-
tion of government activities in developing 
economic progress, increasing domestic 
income, achieving economic stability, and 
ensuring general development goals and 
priorities. The government’s fiscal policy 
as outlined in the State Revenue and Ex-
penditure Budget (APBN) is an important 
instrument in managing the economy and 
as an effort to realize Indonesia’s ideals of 
independence, the APBN is expected to be 
able to create macroeconomic conditions 
that can support the economy. achieving 
the economic growth targets that have 
been set (Rahim & Saputra, 2018). Eco-
nomic growth cannot be separated from 
the role of financial institutions that super-
vise all state transactions. Development 
activities have a relationship between the 
development of the banking sector and the 
economic growth of a country. The impor-
tance of economic stimulus in the realm of 
APBN policy, the Ministry of Finance must 
ensure that the management of APBN 
funds continues to run well even in crises, 
national economic and fiscal sustainabil-
ity in national crises such as the Covid-19 
pandemic. This pandemic relies heavily 
on revenues to distribute the expenditure 
necessary to address the problem. country 
(Nur, 2020).
 In 1983, in the New Order era, eco-
nomic growth in Indonesia began to expe-
rience the beginning of an economic crisis 
with an economic growth rate of 12,842.2 
billion rupiah with a percentage of 4.2 per-
cent due to the decline in commodity prices 
in that year’s era. The monetary crisis that 
hit Indonesia in 1998 resulted in a decline 
in the economic sector which was shown 
at a -13.1 percent economic growth rate at 
that time. Economic growth has increased, 
but in 2012 the country was affected 
by the global crisis which resulted in the 
economy weakening. The economy expe-
rienced a global crisis in 2020 which could 
be felt by all countries in the world, namely 
the COVID-19 pandemic crisis. The eco-
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nomic growth experienced a setback un-
til it reached a minus percentage figure of 
-2.1, however, the government was able to 
handle this with policies such as allocat-
ing funds distributed in handling the Covid 
pandemic, however, the government paid 
little attention to other sectors which had 
quite a deep impact on poverty and unem-
ployment levels. The pandemic problem 
will still be felt today in various sectors be-
cause world problems will have an impact 
on the economies of other countries such 
as the Indonesian economy. This increase 
in growth has not been able to free Indo-
nesia from poverty and unemployment due 
to the government’s failure to overcome 
economic problems. Fluctuations in eco-
nomic growth can have an impact on the 
economic sector and serve as material for 
discussion at the national and international 
levels (Purba & Saputra, 2018).
 Based on research identification, 
there are research gaps and novelties 
described in this research which discuss 
poverty, employment, unemployment, and 
state income on economic growth. Many 
studies do not discuss state income which 
makes this research a novelty. There are 
several previous studies that have related 
discussions.
 Korankye et al., (2021) analyzing 
development finance, economic growth, 
and poverty shows that short-term eco-
nomic growth does not have a significant 
impact on poverty levels. However, in re-
search analyzed by (Wistantri & Bintarin-
ingtyas, 2023) the variables HDI, TPAK, 
poverty, CO2 emissions, and the number 
of MSMEs at the poverty level have a sig-
nificant negative influence on economic 
growth. In the research carried out (Rapii, 
2020), poverty has an influence on the de-
velopment of economic growth according 
to standards in the form of analysis carried 
out. This previous research used qualita-
tive methods in the form of SLQ and DLQ 
analysis. This shows that poverty is a fatal 
problem and must be addressed immedi-

ately so that there is a reduction in poverty 
levels. In research conducted (Artaningtyas 
et al., 2019) regarding agglomeration pro-
duction and population agglomeration 
on economic growth, the level of poverty 
has an impact on economic growth with 
the research results having a significant 
negative value. This is different from those 
(Zuhdiyaty & Kaluge, 2018) who analyzed 
HDI, TPT, and economic growth, showing 
that they do not have an impact on pov-
erty, nor does poverty have an impact on 
economic growth. This is a reflection of the 
lack of quality of economic growth in eradi-
cating existing poverty, research This is in 
contrast to the analysis of the determinants 
of poverty by (Kamilah et al., 2022) which 
shows a significant level of poverty, namely 
that the negative coefficient has an effect 
on economic growth which results in an in-
crease in population in a certain period and 
is not balanced with existing employment.
 Therefore, the importance of the 
government’s role is to take responsibility 
for providing workers’ rights to work and a 
decent income, the government is respon-
sible for employment opportunities with 
regulations and protection of rights through 
labor regulations, then the short-term and 
long-term influence on economic growth is 
caused by one of the factors is the work-
force in the research analyzed (Indrajaya, 
2021), namely the workforce, government 
spending, FDI on economic growth using 
the VECM model. In line with the analysis 
of foreign debt, labor force, and net exports 
on economic growth by (Nur Annisa et al., 
2022) that factors related to employment 
have a significant positive impact on eco-
nomic development in Indonesia, the avail-
ability of demand in the form of the number 
of workers must proportional to the amount 
of job provision as a form of preventing 
unemployment which will have an impact 
on the Indonesian economy. In research 
(Sutikno, 2020) analyzing investment, 
exports, labor force, capital expenditure, 
and HDI shown in the average economy 
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in Indonesia caused by the level of the la-
bor force with a positive significance level. 
Finding similarities in research results (Yei-
sa & Rani, 2020) that labor has a signifi-
cant positive relationship, this is evidence 
that labor can increase the productivity of 
goods and services in a country. Also in 
(Ferreira et al., 2022) analyzing the influ-
ence of capital, labor, and technology on 
economic growth on the island of Java, 
the labor variable has a significantly posi-
tive relationship with the economy. Accord-
ing to (Saimul & Arif Darmawan, 2020) in 
research on the influence of openness on 
economic growth in Indonesian provinces, 
labor output has a significant negative in-
fluence. The negative and positive impacts 
of labor growth depend on the capability of 
a country’s or regional economic system 
to absorb and utilize the increase in labor. 
Productive work, in other words, depends 
on how elastic the employment opportuni-
ties that can be generated by economic 
progress are. In contrast to research that 
analyzed economic growth factors in 10 
ASEAN countries (Sari & Kaluge, 2018) 
that economic growth was not influenced 
by the level of labor force participation as 
evidenced by the fact that there was no 
significant value for this indicator, contrary 
to the neoclassical theory which states that 
increasing the production factors of capital, 
labor, and technology are tools for measur-
ing the development of an economy.
 According to (Irushad et al., 2023), 
research on the drivers of unemployment 
using the ARDL model shows that unem-
ployment has a significant effect on long-
term negative economic growth. This 
suggests that economic growth enables 
a country’s productivity by reducing unem-
ployment to a relatively low level. In addi-
tion, the negative relationship between un-
employment and economic growth shows 
that reducing unemployment will ensure 
economic growth, as a result, the impact 
of Okun’s law coefficient shows a negative 
relationship between unemployment and 

economic growth because the slow rate 
is the reason the number of unemployed 
increases is found in research on the re-
lationship between unemployment and 
economic growth by (Al-kasbah, 2022) 
unemployment has a negative impact. 
Having research in common (Isrofil & Suk-
mana, 2020) that the unemployment rate 
has a negative influence, these results can 
illustrate that the influence of the unem-
ployment rate on Gross Domestic Product 
(GDP) is significantly negative, this identi-
fies every large or small increase in eco-
nomic growth influenced by the unemploy-
ment rate.
 Anindyntha, (2023) with research 
on inclusive growth in ASEAN countries 
explains that the unemployment rate 
variable has significant negative conse-
quences that have an impact on a coun-
try’s economy. The increasing number of 
workers who have no work or are unem-
ployed will cause people’s income to de-
crease even to the point of being negative 
due to not getting wages, making people 
unable to meet their daily needs. This will 
show that economic growth is measured 
through production, income, and spending 
will decrease as unemployment increas-
es. In contrast to research (Pertiwi et al., 
2023) regarding the influence of exports, 
investment, and unemployment on eco-
nomic growth in 1990-2020 short-term and 
long-term unemployment did not occur sig-
nificantly. This shows the opposite relation-
ship to the explanation of Okun’s law which 
has a significantly negative relationship 
between economic growth and unemploy-
ment. Even though the results presented 
have an insignificant value, Indonesia’s 
economic growth is influenced by the level 
of poverty which tends to be positive. Sev-
eral things can cause the relationship be-
tween results to be insignificant and have 
a positive value, such as Indonesia being 
known as a country that relies on the ability 
of human labor rather than the use of ma-
chine power with the term labor intensive 
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aimed at accommodating all existing labor 
and providing employment opportunities. 
This time, simultaneously the number of 
unemployed and the number of workers 
available as well as the limited number of 
employees, the company must optimize its 
production capacity so that it is necessary 
to maximize the available workforce and 
this results in the number of working hours 
increasing. The addition of working hours 
will increase employees’ income and can 
influence consumption levels. The high 
level of public absorption of domestic prod-
ucts makes economic growth soar and will 
increase.
 Regarding a country’s income 
(Panshak et al., 2020), in the Nigerian 
economy, there was a significant decline 
in state income relative to gross domestic 
product (GDP). During this period, there 
was a government budget deficit in Nige-
ria, but the movement showed signs of im-
provement, especially as the government 
adopted an expansionary fiscal policy for 
employment and addressed shortfalls in 
subsequent years bringing GDP in line with 
analogous universal standards. However, 
this is different from research that ana-
lyzes the impact of the pandemic on the 
economic sector (Malahayati et al., 2021) 
that a country’s state income has a nega-
tive impact on economic growth during the 
pandemic, but not only that, several sec-
tors in a country’s economy also experi-
ence negative shocks due to the Covid 
pandemic. -19. However, the government 
is promoting state incentives for restoring 
economic growth during the pandemic cri-
sis to support the economy. Poverty, em-
ployment, unemployment, and the state 
expenditure budget have an interrelated 
relationship, reducing poverty, unemploy-
ment, and increasing employment and the 
APBN should be able to increase the rate 
of economic growth well. However, the fact 
is that the level of poverty, employment, 
unemployment, and the APBN often fluctu-
ates so it has not been able to increase the 

level of the economy in Indonesia. Optimal 
income distribution for poverty eradication 
by providing job opportunities will have the 
effect of reducing poverty and increasing 
the social status of the population. The 
APBN contribution is one of the policies 
carried out by the country to advance its 
economy. Therefore, the purpose of this 
research is to understand the level of pov-
erty, employment, unemployment, and the 
APBN’s long-term or short-term influence 
on economic growth in Indonesia.

METHODOLOGY
 The method used for research is 
an associative descriptive method with a 
quantitative type because the focus of the 
research is testing and measuring research 
variables in the form of numbers and statis-
tical techniques are used to estimate data. 
The determination of the independent vari-
able is based on Keynes’ theory which 
has a relationship between variables, the 
occurrence of economic depreciation re-
sulting in reduced job market absorption, 
increasing unemployment, and increasing 
the poor population which results in con-
sumption expenditure, therefore there is a 
need for government intervention in over-
coming maximum economic growth. The 
operational definition of the dependent 
variable in this research is that economic 
growth is the amount of economic output 
with indicators of Gross Domestic Product 
based on business fields. Meanwhile, in 
the independent variable, the poverty level 
is the condition of a person or group not 
being able to meet their basic capabilities, 
the indicator is the percentage of the poor 
population, and employment is all relations 
related to labor in the form of an indicator of 
the level of labor force participation, while 
unemployment is the condition of a person 
not yet working or looking for work. The in-
dicator for this variable is the percentage 
of the open unemployment rate, and the 
State Revenue and Expenditure Budget 
(APBN), namely the form of state capital 



Sherlinda Ardyana Pramesty & Happy Adianita. MediaTrend 18 (2) 2023 p.271-287

277

for economic growth with the focus of the 
indicator being the realization of state in-
come in percent of the APBN.
 This research uses the ECM (Error 
Correction Model) error correlation model 
approach to produce long-term and short-
term estimates with quantitative research 
where the data used is time series data for 
the period 1983-2022. The type of second-
ary data in this research is publication data 
that has been collected by the data col-
lection agency Central Statistics Agency. 
Economic growth in this observation was 
carried out using annual data on the rate of 
economic growth for the period 1983-2022 
using percent (%) as the measurement. 
Using this data is more efficient because 
the data used is more than one variable. 
The analysis using time series data with the 
Error Correction Model (ECM) approach.  
The stationarity test is the initial stage, 
namely testing the level of data stationarity 
with the main series in starting data analy-
sis using. This test uses a unit root test or 
is called unit root testing in the Augmented 
Dickey-Fuller (ADF) test. Statistical results 
at the probability level are evaluated with 
the critical value obtained when the signifi-
cant value is above 5%, then the residual 
results do not have stationarity. However, 
if the probability is below 0.05, the residual 
data will be stationary. The next stage is 
testing to overcome problems in time se-
ries data in the long-term relationship be-
tween variables, called the cointegration 
test. The residual test is carried out to de-
termine whether variables that have the 
same degree of integration are stationary 
or not. Engel and Granger stated that the 
cointegration test is considered a prelimi-
nary test to avoid false regressions (Effen-
di, 2018). The method in this research is 
the Engel-Granger integration method with 
the ADF method. The residual value is sta-
tionary at what level so that the combina-
tion of variables in the study is stationary.
 The difference between reality and 
the desired economic behavior requires ad-

justment. As a result, a method is needed 
to return the short-term balance to closer 
to the long-term balance. The appropriate 
method for correcting imbalances is the Er-
ror Correction Model (ECM). The long-term 
ECM estimation form is:

Yt = β0 + β1X1t + β2X2t + β3X3t + β4X4t + ɛt

where Y is Economic Growth, β0 is Inter-
cept β1,2,3,4 is Regression Coefficient, X1 is 
Poverty ,X2 is Employment, X3 is Unem-
ployment, X4 is APBN, t is Time Series, ɛt 
is Error Term
 Furthermore, the short-term model 
equation that has been differentiated at the 
first different level is as follows:

D(Yt )= β0 + β1D(X1t) + β2D(X2t)+ β3D(X3t)+ 
β4D(X4t) + β5ECTlag1+ ɛt

 The classical assumption test is to 
determine that this research’s regression 
results meet the BLUE (Best Linear Un-
biased Estimator) requirements and there 
are no Error Correction Model deviations 
from the classical assumptions. Normality 
testing is used to find out whether short-
term residuals are normally distributed. 
Through the Jaeque-Bera test with a sig-
nificance level of 5%, the data is normally 
distributed if the probability value is above 
the significance level. This test is to deter-
mine a definite linear relationship between 
several variables or all variables explaining 
the regression model. The test was carried 
out to determine whether the regression 
was free and did not have heteroscedastic-
ity problems in the ECM model. The auto-
correlation test aims to identify whether or 
not there are symptoms of autocorrelation 
in regression.

RESULTS AND DISCUSSION
 Descriptive testing is carried out to 
provide an overview of the variables to be 
studied. the management of descriptive
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statistical analysis shows the sample size 
studied such as the average (mean), maxi-
mum, minimum, standard deviation of each 
variable. The results of the descriptive sta-
tistical test can be shown in the following 
table 1.
 The results of the descriptive sta-
tistical test shown in table 1 with the num-
ber of observations in the study were 40 
data from 1983 to 2022. Economic growth 
(Y) has a minimum value of -13.1 which is 
the value of the decline in growth in this re-
search period. The highest growth value is 
11.8 with Indonesia’s economic growth rate 
showing an average of 4.9. The highest 
poverty ratio was 29.2 and the lowest was 
9.3 with an average of 16.6. The employ-
ment ratio and the highest was 69.2 and 
the lowest was 55.5 and the average was 
63.9. The highest unemployment ratio was 
17.3 and the lowest was 2.6 with a mean 
of 6.2 and a standard deviation of 2.9. 
The highest figure of the state budget was 
132.0 with the lowest value of 73.8 and an 

average of 101.7. The variety of values de-
termined by the analysis conducted shows 
that the variable indicators reflect macro-
economic variations in Indonesia.
 The results of the normality test on 
the classical assumptions used with the 
Jarque-Bera method show that the prob-
ability value is greater than 0.05 so that the 
data is normally distributed.
 The results of the VIF value in the 
multicollinearity test of less than 10 are de-
clared free from mulikoleniarity problems, 
on the other hand, if the VIF value is more 
than 10, the research states that there is a 
multicollinearity problem.
 The probability value of Obs R2 
of 0.7557 indicates that there is no het-
eroscedasticity using the Glejser method 
in the study has a probability value of more 
than a significant level of 0.05.
 There is an Obs R2 probability value 
of 0.0716, this shows that there is no auto-
correlation in the study because the prob-
ability value of a significant level of 0.05.

Table 1.
Descriptive Statistics

               Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12

               Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12
Figure 1.

Classical Assumption Test Results, Normality Test
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 The initial step in testing the Error 
Correction Model is the estimation results 
for the short-term and long-term equations 
using the unit root test or stationary test to 
find out in advance whether the variables 
under study have met the level of stationar-
ity or not. This experiment was carried out 
to ensure that the results of calculations 
made on time series data were not wrong 
and to estimate whether or not the con-
nectivity of variables in the unit root was 
stored to make the equation acceptable. 
Looking at table 5, the results of the unit 
root test levels show that all variables have 
not yet become stationary at level level. It 
can be seen from the probability values of 
economic growth, unemployment, and the 
APBN of 0.0009, 0.0101, 0.0009 < 0.05 
that they are stationary, but the probability

 that the poverty and employment variables 
have values more than the significance 
level, namely 0.7245, 0.5735 > 0.05, there-
fore it must be done by testing the unit root 
test on the first derivative, namely the level 
of the first difference. Obtaining a signifi-
cant level that has passed the first different 
unit root test, it is found that all variables 
have an ADF scale with a significant value 
at a probability level that is smaller than the 
results of certain criteria of 0.05 (5%) so 
that the data is declared stationary data at 
the first different level. To find out long-term 
parameters, the next test is the cointegra-
tion test.
 The use of the Augmented Dick-
ey-Fuller (ADF) test as a way to review 
whether the cointegration residual value is 
stationary or not at all. The cointegration 

Table 2.
Classical Assumption Test Results, Multicollinearity Test 

Table 3.
Classical Assumption Test Results, Heteroscedasticity Test

Table 4.
Classical Assumption Test Results, Autocorrelation Test

               Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12

            Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12

                  Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12
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test shows how closely the relationship be-
tween various economic factor variables 
is when in the long-term equation. If the 
conditions for the cointegration test are ap-
plied, if a probability result or level of signif-
icance <0.05 (5%) is obtained with an ADF 
t-statistic value greater than the test criti-
cal values, it is indicated that the variables 
studied by this research have been well in-
tegrated. Based on table 6, it is shown that 
the critical value is smaller than the ADF 
t-statistic value, namely -5.837549 with a 
significant value so that it has experienced 
stationarity in the cointegration test, which 
means there is an equilibrium bond in the 
long-term equation. The use of OLS re-
gression testing carried out on eviews 12 
is useful for understanding the long-term 
impact of the independent variable on the 
dependent variable. From this test, what 
will be the influence of poverty (X1), em-
ployment (X2), unemployment (X3) and 
APBN (X4) on economic growth (Y).
 The results of the Error Correction 
Model with OLS regression on the eviews 
analysis tool, the estimated long-term re-
sults are as follows table 7.

 It can be seen from the results of the 
OLS calculations in the ECM model in ta-
ble 7 that all variables are significant at the 
significance level, namely the poverty (X1) 
employment (X2), unemployment (X3) and 
APBN (X4) variables in the long term have 
a significant impact on economic growth 
with the probability values are 0.0021, 
0.0007, 0.0128 and 0.0035. The difference 
in the coefficient of significance level in the 
poverty and employment variables has a 
significant negative effect with values of 
-0.380255 and -0.453818, while the un-
employment and APBN variables have a 
significantly positive impact with coefficient 
values of 0.491886 and 0.134630. Values 
can be said to be significant if the signifi-
cance level is <0.05 or 5%. This proves the 
regression results between the correlation 
between the independent variable and the 
dependent variable with the independent 
variables being poverty (poor population), 
employment (TPAK), unemployment (TPT) 
and APBN (state income). The dependent 
variable is economic growth (GDP). The 
probability level of the poverty variable 

            Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12

Table 5.
Stationaryity Test Results

Table 6.
Cointegration Test Results

               Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12
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from the regression results can be seen 
that there is a significant negative influ-
ence with a coefficient value of -0.380255 
which means that when an increase of 1% 
in the poverty level results in a decrease 
in economic development of -0.380255 
as well as the employment variable which 
has a negative significance for every 1% 
increase in the level. employment will re-
duce economic growth by -0.453818. In 
contrast to the unemployment variable 
and the APBN, when it experiences a de-
cline, it will be able to increase economic 
growth by 0.491886 for the unemployment 
variable and 0.134630 for the APBN. The 
Adjusted R-Squared result of 0.341137 
describes the independent variable in the 
dependent variable model which means 
34.1137 percent in the long term and the 
rest is explained by factors not examined 
by the researcher. The F-statistic value of 
6.048228 proves that the variables in the 
long-term regression model such as pov-
erty, employment, unemployment and the 
APBN simultaneously influence the rate of 
economic growth.

 Based on the ECM estimation re-
sults above in table 8, it can be observed 
that the t-statistic value for the explana-
tory variable ECT (Error Correction Term) 

is significant with a value of 4.937616 and 
meets the requirements of 0 < ECT < 1, the 
ECT coefficient must be 0-1 which is indi-
cated by a value of 0.792262 so it means 
that the error correlation model can be 
used to analyze factors that influence eco-
nomic growth. In this regression model, the 
employment variables (X2) and APBN (X4) 
have a significant influence on economic 
growth as shown in the probability value 
of less than the significance figure of 0.05 
or (5%). It can be seen that the probabil-
ity values for the variables are 0.0320 and 
0.000 with coefficient values of -0.664155 
and 0.212823. This shows that the vari-
ables have a direct influence on economic 
growth negatively and positively in the em-
ployment and APBN variables in the short 
term, whereas the poverty and unemploy-
ment variables have no effect on growth. 
the economy directly but has a negative 
impact of -0.213647 on the poverty level 
and a positive impact of c on the unem-
ployment variable on short-term economic 
growth. The adjusted R-squared number is 
0.681426, so 68.1426 percent of the varia-

tion in economic growth is obtained from 
the independent variables, namely pover-
ty (X1), employment (X2), unemployment 
(X3), and APBN (X4) while the difference 

                  Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12

Table 7.
Long Run Test Result
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is explained by other variables outside this 
research.
 The ECM model in the analysis 
shows that the level of poverty has a sig-
nificant impact on economic growth in the 
long term. This can be seen at a signifi-
cance level of 0.0021 and has a negative 
influence as indicated by the coefficient 
value of the poverty variable -0.380255. 
From existing theory, poverty and eco-
nomic growth have the opposite correla-
tion. When the poverty level increases by 
1 percent, economic growth will decrease 
by 0.380255. Meanwhile, in short-term es-
timates, poverty does not have a direct im-

pact on economic growth but can explain it 
negatively with a coefficient of -0.213647. 
The results of previous research state that 
poverty has a significant and negative ef-
fect on economic growth, this shows that 
poverty and the economy have a conflict-
ing relationship (Tampubolon et al., 2022) 
and are in line with research (Yudha & Pur-
wanti, 2023) analyzing economic growth 
on poverty explained that the rate of eco-
nomic growth has not been able to over-
come welfare problems, but is important in 
eradicating poverty in economic develop-
ment programs. This indicates that limita-

tions in economic activity have an impact 
on meeting basic needs such as welfare, 
education and others. The level of poverty 
in a country can have a negative influence 
on a country’s economic growth.
 Long-term estimation results show 
that employment significantly negatively 
affects economic growth. Marked with a 
significant value and a negative coefficient, 
it explains that every 1 percent increase in 
employment will reduce economic growth 
by -0.453818. This has similarities to short-
term estimates which have a significant 
negative impact. In previous research, em-
ployment growth is influenced by regional 

determinants such as low technological 
development which will be able to exploit 
the economy (Bin et al., 2020) along with 
research outlined by (Wu et al., 2021) that 
GDP and labor have a significant impact 
negative in several developed countries 
which are interconnected so that the dis-
connection of involvement can reduce em-
ployment and economic growth. The role 
of surplus labor has an influence on struc-
tural changes and economic growth in de-
veloped and developing countries.
 Estimates in the long term of unem-
ployment have a significant positive impact 

Table 8.
Short-Term ECM Regression Equation Results

                   Source: Analysis Results Of Eviews 12
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in accordance with (Chattopadhyay, 2020) 
unemployment will increase over time and 
economic growth will become a serious 
problem if it continues in the long term, 
while in the short term it shows that the un-
employment variable has no direct impact 
on economic growth in this period. This 
is supported by research conducted by 
(Brecher & Gross, 2020) that the problem 
of unemployment is balanced by capital 
and workforce skills so that there is a clear 
relationship between increasing unem-
ployment and economic growth, but basi-
cally capital will increase when the portion 
of capital that fails will can slow econom-
ic growth. Contrary to Okun’s law which 
states a negative relationship between 
economic growth and unemployment. Im-
plying that when unemployment increases 
it will result in reducing economic growth. 
“Inflation, Unemployment, and Economic 
Growth in a Schumpeterian Economy” re-
searched by (Chu et al., 2021) shows that 
increasing long-term unemployment can 
reduce labor demand with CIA limits result-
ing in a long-term positive relationship on 
economic growth.
 Previous research “APBN 2020: 
Analysis of State Revenue Performance 
During the Covid-19 Pandemic” by (Say-
adi, 2021) state revenue performance dur-
ing the Covid-19 pandemic period has a 
significant effect on economic growth, the 
level of significance of state income in long-
term and short-term regression results can 
be This means that when state income in-
creases, it will be followed by an increase 
in economic growth and vice versa. Dur-
ing the Covid-19 pandemic, state income 
decreased compared to the previous year. 
The suitability of the theory is that capital 
and government intervention are needed in 
handling problems in economic growth. Si-
multaneously with (Gao & Zhen, 2018) sig-
nificant revenue reform has achieved prog-
ress to avoid and reduce fiscal stress as 
a goal of balancing the economy towards 
budget revenues and expenditures. In line 

with research conducted by (Coulibaly et 
al., 2018), capital flows have a positive and 
significant impact on economic growth, so 
it can be seen that state income is able to 
have an impact on increasing the rate of 
economic growth of a country.

CONCLUSIONS
 Based on the results of the estima-
tion of the poverty rate through ECM in the 
long term is significantly negative on eco-
nomic growth which means that poverty 
actually makes a reduction in the rate of 
economic growth in the long term in the 
Indonesian economy. Economic growth is 
influenced by poverty in the long term but 
not in the short term which has not been 
able to explain the variables in this period. 
The employment variable using long-term 
ECM has a negative direct effect that has 
a significant impact on the rate of develop-
ment of the country’s economy in line with 
the short-term economic rate is significant-
ly negatively affected by the employment 
variable on the labor force participation 
rate indicator.
 The unemployment rate of ECM re-
sults in the long-term estimation that eco-
nomic growth is able to be affected by the 
economy but different short-term estima-
tion results unemployment does not have 
a direct effect and is positive on economic 
growth. The results of the APBN variable 
using the same model, namely ECM, ex-
plain that the long-term and short-term 
APBN has a significant impact on econom-
ic growth in Indonesia positively. It is ex-
pected that the government is able to take 
action on the rate of economic growth and 
eradicate poverty, which has a crucial ef-
fect on the process of improving the coun-
try’s economy. The importance of the gov-
ernment’s role in regulating and managing 
the labor absorption process reaches an 
optimal level to minimize the crisis of pov-
erty and unemployment. Maximum labor 
absorption is certainly balanced by the 
amount of employment and optimization of 



Analysis of Determinants........ MediaTrend 18 (2) 2023 p.271-287

284

budget allocations has a role in the avail-
ability of employment and employment 
opportunities. So that the depreciation of 
unemployment and poverty makes the 
mechanism of increasing economic growth 
expected.
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